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SCI (the Steel Construction Institute) has been a trusted, independent source of 
information and engineering expertise globally for over 30 years, and is one of the 
leading, independent providers of technical expertise and disseminator of best practice 
to the steel construction sector. 

We support everyone involved in steel construction; from manufacturers, consulting and 
design engineers, architects, product developers to industry groups. 

 

 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

Version Issue Date Purpose Author Reviewer Approved 
01  11/06/2020 Issued for comments RJP DGB DGB 

02  21/10/2020 Software release RJP DGB DGB 

       

Although all care has been taken to ensure that all the information contained herein is 
accurate, The Steel Construction Institute assumes no responsibility for any errors or 
misinterpretations or any loss or damage arising therefrom. 
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Licence Agreement 

INTRODUCTION 
 
COLABORANTE Composite Slab Design Software is a software licensed, not sold. Use 
of this software is subject to license restrictions. Carefully read this license agreement 
before using the software. Use of software indicates complete and unconditional 
acceptance of the terms and conditions set forth in this agreement. Any additional or 
different purchase order terms and conditions shall not apply. 
 
END-USER LICENSE AGREEMENT ('AGREEMENT') FOR NO-CHARGE 
SOFTWARE 
 
Checking 'I accept the terms of the license agreement.' or installing and/or using the 
Software (defined below) establishes a binding agreement between Colaborante ('CT') 
and you as the person or entity licensing the Software ('Customer'); provided that if you 
are accepting this Agreement on behalf of a legal entity, you represent that you have the 
authority to bind such entity to this Agreement, in which case the term 'Customer' refers 
to such entity. If you do not have such authority or if you do not accept all of the terms of 
this agreement, immediately return, or if received electronically, certify destruction of 
software and all accompanying items, and you will receive a full refund of any license 
fee paid. 
 
1. SOFTWARE; OWNERSHIP; GRANT OF LICENSE. 
 
1.1 The software, including any upgrades, updates, modifications, revisions, copies, and 
documentation made available by CT ('Software'), is available for download by Customer 
at no charge. To the extent Customer requests and CT accepts a request to download 
the Software from CT's customer centre, each such request will constitute a contract 
between Customer and CT, which shall be governed solely and exclusively by the terms 
and conditions of this Agreement. CT 's delivery of Software by electronic means is 
subject to Customer's provision of an e-mail address. 
 
1.2 Software, including all copies and documentation, is copyrighted, trade secret and 
confidential information of CT or its licensors, who maintain exclusive title to all Software 
and retain all rights not expressly granted by this Agreement. You must hold CT 
confidential information in strict confidence. CT grants to Customer, subject to 
Customer's compliance with the terms and conditions of this Agreement, a non-
transferable, nonexclusive license to use Software solely for Customer's business 
purposes. Customer acknowledges that CT may discontinue the no-charge program at 
any time. Each order for Software will identify the Software, license unit of measure, and 
any time period restriction, if applicable. Such limitations may be technically implemented 
through the use of authorization codes, license keys, or similar devices. Customer may 
choose to, but is not required to, provide suggestions, data, or other information to CT 
regarding possible improvements in the operation, functionality or use of Software, 
whether in the course of receiving services, evaluating Software or otherwise, and any 
inventions, product improvements, modifications or developments made by CT, at its 
sole discretion, will be the exclusive property of CT. 
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2. CONDITIONS 
 
2.1 Customer shall not loan, rent, lease, distribute, or otherwise transfer Software without 
CT 's prior written consent, except as part of a permanent transfer of the Software as 
permitted by this Agreement. Customer may copy Software only as reasonably 
necessary to support the authorized use, as long as the number of licenses in use does 
not exceed the number of licenses purchased by Customer. Each copy must include all 
notices embedded in Software as received from CT. All copies remain the property of 
CT or its licensors. Customer shall not: (a) use the Software or allow its use for 
developing, enhancing or marketing any product that is competitive with the Software; or 
(b) disclose to any third party the results of or information pertaining to any testing of the 
Products against a third party's products for the purpose of competitive comparison. 
Customer shall not reverse-assemble, reverse-compile, reverse-engineer or in any way 
derive source code from Software. 
 
2.2 Customer may allow third party consultants or contractors ('Authorized Third Parties') 
to access and use the Software on Customer's behalf as long as: (a) the use is solely for 
Customer's internal business operations; (b) each Authorized Third Party is underwritten 
confidentiality obligations with Customer protecting CT's intellectual property and 
Confidential Information with terms no less stringent than this Agreement; (c) Customer 
ensures that the Authorized Third Party's use of the Software complies with the terms of 
this Agreement; and (d) on completion of the Authorized Third Party's services requiring 
use of the Software, Customer ensures that the Software are immediately and 
completely uninstalled from Authorized Third Party's equipment and/or premises, as 
applicable. 
 
2.3 Customer may move the Software: (a) from one node (i.e. authorized hardware) to 
another without charge; and (b) from one site to another site. No transfer under this 
section shall increase the license scope or number of nodes in use by Customer. Except 
as provided herein, Customer shall not sublicense, assign or otherwise transfer the 
Software without CT's prior written consent and payment of CT's then-current applicable 
transfer charges. Any attempted transfer without CT's prior written consent shall be a 
material breach of this Agreement and may, at CT 's option, result in the immediate 
termination of the licenses and this Agreement. On CT 's written request, Customer will 
furnish to CT: (a) a certification signed by an officer indicating whether the Software is 
being used in accordance with this Agreement; and (b) a copy of any usage reports 
generated from the Software, if applicable. CT may engage an independent auditor to 
review Customer's Software usage and related records during Customer 's normal 
business hours to confirm compliance with this Agreement. 
 
3. CUSTOMER RESPONSIBILITIES; DISCLAIMER OF WARRANTIES; NO 
SUPPORT. 
 
Customer is solely responsible for selecting the Software to achieve its intended results, 
and for the installation of, use of, and results obtained from the Software. Customer is 
solely responsible for compliance with all laws, rules and regulations applicable to 
Customer's use of the Software. Customer is solely responsible for any taxes, customs 
duties or similar charges arising out of Customer's receipt or use of the Software. The 
Software is made available by CT without warranty of any kind. CT and its licensors 
expressly disclaim any and all warranties of any nature, express or implied, including 
without limitation any warranties of merchantability, fitness for purpose or non-
infringement. CT support services are not available for no-charge Software. CT may, but 
is not required to, make patches, updates and upgrades to the Software available from 
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time to time. Installation and use of such releases are governed by the terms of this 
Agreement. 
 
4. DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY. 
 
The Software is provided to Customer at no-charge. CT and its licensors shall have no 
liability for any damages whatsoever. Without limiting the foregoing, in no event shall CT 
or its licensors be liable for direct, punitive, exemplary, indirect, special, incidental, or 
consequential damages (including lost data, lost profits or savings) whether based on 
contract, tort or any other legal theory, even if CT or its licensors have been advised of 
the possibility of such damages. Customer acknowledges that the Software is provided 
at no-charge, reflecting the allocation of risk set forth in this Agreement and that CT 
would not enter into this Agreement or offer the Software at no charge without these 
limitations on its liability. Some jurisdictions do not allow the exclusion or limitation of 
liability for certain damages for certain types of claims, so the above limitation may not 
apply to you to the extent prohibited by such local laws. 
 
 
5. TERM AND TERMINATION. 
 
This Agreement remains effective until terminated. This Agreement will immediately 
terminate upon notice if Customer exceeds the scope of license granted or otherwise 
fails to comply with Sections 1 or 2. For any other material breach under this Agreement, 
CT may terminate this Agreement upon 30 days written notice if Customer is in material 
breach and fails to cure such breach within the 30-day notice period. If a Software license 
was provided for limited term use, such license will automatically terminate at the end of 
the authorized term. Customer may terminate this Agreement at any time by providing 
written notice to CT. On termination of this Agreement or any Software license under this 
Agreement, Customer shall ensure that all use of the affected Software ceases, and shall 
certify the destruction of all copies of the Software used by Customer to CT 's reasonable 
satisfaction. The following sections will survive any termination of this Agreement: 1-4 
and 6-7. 
 
6. EXPORT. 
 
Customer agrees to comply with all international and national laws that apply to the 
Software. 
 
7. GENERAL TERMS. 
 
This Agreement shall be governed by and construed in all respects in accordance with 
the laws of Portugal; however, this provision shall not restrict CT 's right to bring an action 
against Customer or its subsidiary in the jurisdiction where Customer's or its subsidiary's 
place of business is located. This Agreement may only be modified in writing by 
authorized representatives of the parties. All notices required or authorized under this 
Agreement must be in writing and shall be sent, as applicable, to Customer's legal 
department. Waiver of terms or excuse of breach must be in writing and shall not 
constitute subsequent consent, waiver or excuse. 

 
 

 


